BID TABULATION
Quarry Products
Bid #PUR0218-139

March 19, 2018 at 3:00 pm CDT

VENDORS CJ Moyna & Sons, Crawford Quarry Wendling Quarries, Inc.
Inc. Company
Vendor Location Cedar Rapids, IA Cedar Rapids, IA Robins, IA
Buy Local Certificate Yes Yes Yes
Line Item Description
LIME Price per Ton Price per Ton Price per Ton
1 Aglime no bid $4.00 $3.15
2 3/8" Minus/Limefill $2.50 $4.00 $3.15
3 Lime $2.50 $4.00 $3.15
ROADSTONE
1 Class A Roadstone $10.00 $10.00 $10.25
2 Class A 3/4" Roadstone $10.00 $10.00 $10.25
3 1" Roadstone $10.00 $10.00 $10.25
4 1-1/2" Roadstone $10.00 no bid $10.25
5 2" Roadstone $10.00 $10.00 $10.25
6 Farmer's Rock no bid no bid $10.25
7 3" Road Rock $10.00 $10.00 $10.25
8 Granular Subbase $10.90 $10.00 $11.25
9 Modified Subbase $10.00 $10.00 $10.75
GRAVEL
1 3/8" no bid no bid $19.00 (1/2" pea gravel)
2 3/4" no bid no bid $25.00
3 Septic 3/4" x 2-1/2" no bid no bid $29.00
4 Oversize no bid $10.50 $25.00
5 Granular Backfill no bid $10.00 $8.00
6 Porous Backfill no bid $12.50 $12.95
CLEAN STONE
1 3/4" Clean no bid no bid $12.95
2 1" Clean $11.30 $10.50 $12.95
3 2" Clean $11.30 $10.50 $11.95
4 3" x 1" Macadam $11.30 $10.50 $11.95
5 Oversize no bid $10.50 no bid
6 Erosion Stone $14.25 $14.00 $17.50
CONCRETE STONE
1 3/4" Concrete Stone no bid no bid $16.75
2 1" Concrete Stone no bid no bid $16.75

PEA GRAVEL/CHIPS




March 19, 2018 at 3:00 pm CDT

BID TABULATION
Quarry Products
Bid #PUR0218-139

VENDORS CJ Moyna & Sons, Crawford Quarry Wendling Quarries, Inc.
Inc. Company
Vendor Location Cedar Rapids, IA Cedar Rapids, IA Robins, IA
Buy Local Certificate Yes Yes Yes
Line Iltem Description
1 1/2" Washed Chips no bid no bid $12.95
2 3/8" Washed Chips no bid $11.50 $12.95
3 3/8" Peagravel no bid no bid $19.00 (1/2" pea gravel)
RIPRAP
1 Crusher Run (Primary) $7.00 $10.00 $10.00
2 Rip Rap (Shot Rock) $6.00 $10.00 $14.75
3 Rip Rap (Class D) $14.75 $14.00 $26.25
4 Rip Rap (Class E) $22.00 no bid $26.25
5 Pit Run Rock no bid $10.00 $14.75
6 Breaker Run $7.00 $15.00 $14.75
7 Shot Rock $6.00 $10.00 $14.75
SAND
1 Concrete no bid no bid $8.75
2 Masonry Sand no bid no bid $9.50
3 Mortar no bid no bid $9.50
4 Fill no bid no bid $7.75
5 Stone Sand no bid no bid $7.75
6 Ice Control Sand no bid no bid $8.75
7 Limestone Sand no bid no bid $7.75
DELIVERY
1 Price per Mile by quotation no bid $3.50 + 0.25/mile
2 Price per Hour by quotation $75.00 $85.00
3 Minimum Delivery Charge by quotation no bid $75.00
4 Price per Ton to Deliver Rock by quotation no bid $4.50
5 Price per Ton to Deliver Sand by quotation no bid $4.75
Signature Page
1 Do You Accept Credit Card for Payment? No No Yes
2 Quick Pay Discount N/A N/A N/A
3 Does Discount Apply to MasterCard? N/A No N/A




